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Objectives

Analyze the status and prospects of sectoral total factor productivity 
(TFP); examine determinants to enhance sectoral labor productivity 
through knowledge spillover effects; provide evidence-based policy 
implications for enhancing productivity in APO member economies; and 
publish the APO Productivity Outlook 2024.

Rationale

In its role as a think tank, the APO publishes the annual APO 
Productivity Outlook series to monitor economic growth performance 
and provide insights on productivity prospects in key sectors in its 
members. Comparative analyses of key trends, factors, and levels of 
sectoral productivity are conducted to foster evidence-based productivity 
policymaking among APO member economies.

Background

Using a sectoral productivity decomposition approach, the APO 
Productivity Outlook 2022 revealed that manufacturing is a crucial 
source of members’ economic dynamics. A main cause of labor 
productivity gaps is the different levels and contributions of 
manufacturing activities. The majority of APO member economies are at 
a low level of technological adoption. Upgrading production capabilities 
is the key to enhancing economic complexity and fostering their long-
term productivity growth. Manufacturing labor productivity gains benefit 
from technology transfers and positive spillovers. Strengthening 
manufacturing will in turn enable the efficient operation of other 
industries (ADBI, 2022).  
 
In the next APO Productivity Outlook edition, emphases are on TFP 
trends and knowledge spillovers in core manufacturing subsectors. 
Barriers to and enablers of knowledge spillovers in the sector and 
relevant policy implications will be included.  

Topics

Manufacturing labor productivity; TFP; Productivity outlooks; Value-
added methods; Employment growth decomposition; Global value chain 
participation; Knowledge spillover effects on productivity; Forward and 
backward linkage effects; and Employment inducement effects. 

Outcome
Strengthened think tank role of the APO; monitoring of productivity 
trends and performance in key sectors; and enhanced productivity 
policymaking in APO members.

Qualifications

Research institution with extensive and specialized knowledge in 
sectoral productivity decomposition, with a track record of publications in 
English on productivity statistics and thematic issues of productivity 
analysis, and with experience in providing advisory services to 
governments.

Please refer to the implementation procedures circulated with this document for further details.
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